

**2018 HURON COUNTY BIDDING**  
**Attachment "A"**  
**Bid Tab**

*The Supplying of 703 Aggregate 2018*

STONE TYPE	TONS	DELIVERED				
		ERIE MATERIALS	MESSENBURG BRO.	MARETT UNLIMITED	J&D FARMS	HANSON
↓	↓	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON
9	3500	\$ 22.00	\$ 14.17	\$ 14.00	No Bid	No Bid
9 Ripley Outpost	1000	\$ 25.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 14.50	No Bid	No Bid
9 DeRussey Outpost	1000	\$ 26.00	\$ 15.24	\$ 15.00	No Bid	No Bid
8	800	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.17	\$ 22.00	No Bid	No Bid
57	200	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.17	\$ 18.00	No Bid	No Bid
67	500	No Bid	\$ 22.17	\$ 22.00	No Bid	No Bid